
CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION 
SPECIAL CALLEO MEETING 

JULY lS, 2021 

CALL TO ORDER ANO WELCOME 
Chairman Clemons called the Commission Meeting to o rder at 9:00 a.m. 

CALL OF ROLL TO ESTABLISH QUORUM 
Tiffany M erriman, County Clerk, ca lled the roll; ~resent were Chairman Jeff Clemons, 
Commissioner Kerry Watson, County Administrator John Bullard, County Attorney Emily 

Johnst on, Count y Engineer Bryan Cheatwood, and EMA Assistant Director Scott McDonald. 

PUBLIC COMMENTS 
No Public Comments 

NEW BUSINESS 
Consider Termination of local Emergency due to the COVID-19 Coronavirus Pandemic. 
Commissioner Marchman made a motion to approve the Termination of Local Emergency due to the 
COVID-19 Coronavirus Pandemic. Commissioner Wat son seconded. The vote passed upon a unanimous 
voice vote. 

Consider participation in the Investing In Alabama Counties Program with the ACCA and authorize 
Chairman to sign agreement. 
County Administrator John Bullard addressed the Commission and stated when we first started looking 
into the Investing in Alabama Counties Program the ACCA put together, there were a lot of questions. As 
we looked at it, the cont ribution percentage has changed over time. The Association settled on 6% of the 
first $7 Million and 4% on any funds received over $7 million. This will cover the legal guidance, 
identifica tion eligibility for industries, identification of appropriate projects, and then development of 
bids, bidding, and project management. When you break that down, that is an average of about a 5% fee 
which is standard across the industry for project management of federal money. Mr. Bullard advised 
Cullman County can get a benefit out of this, and it will be a good va lue for taxpayers. Wit h strength in 
numbers, if we all do the same thing statewide, then we know we are going to be on the same page. When 
it is audited, the Examiners will know what they are looking at as well. Mr. Bullard feels like overall, it will 
be a va lue, and so he made a recommendation to participate. 
Commissioner Marchman thanked County Administrator John Bullard for all he has done with putting all 
this together and gave appreciation to the two Commissioners for their commitment to make sure that 
we do the r ight thing w ith taxpayer's money. Commissioner Marchman abstained from voting due to 
concerns that the County does not have a plan that matches up to what they are saying they can do for 
us. He expressed that we do not know what t hey are going to offer us. Is it going to be a benefit for the 
County? Commissioner Marchman said this is a question mark and does not think this is the appropriate 
action to take. Commissioner Watson made a motion to approve the participation in the Invest ing in 
Alabama Counties Program with t he ACCA and aut horize Chairman to sign agreement. Cha irman Clemons 
seconded. Commissioner Marchman abstained. The motion passed by unanimous voice vote. 



Award Bid #1356: Corrugated Metal Pipe to Twin Oaks Environmental and ADCO Pipe & Supply LLC 
County Engineer Bryan Cheatwood advised this bid will give the County more options on ordering pipe. 
Commissioner Marchman made a motion to Award Bid #1356: Corrugated Metal Pipe to Twin Oaks 
Environmental and ADCO Pipe & Supply LLC. Commissioner Watson seconded. Upon unanimous voice 
vote, the motion carried. 

Award Bid #1357: Lawn care and Maintenance to Pro Lawn 
County Administrator John Bullard advised this is a lawn bid we previously rejected . We went back and 
rebid the contract and took some specs out from the previous bid. The only way you can change the specs 
was to rebid. We received two bids. Pro Lawn was the lowest bidder at $57,000. Commissioner Watson 
made a motion to Award Bid #1357: Lawn Care and Maintenance to Pro Lawn. Commissioner Marchman 
seconded, and the motion passed upon a unanimous voice vote. 

WORK SESSION 
The Commission will hold a Work Session on July 20, 2021, at 4:00 p.m. in the Commission 

Meeting Room. 

NEXT REGULAR COMMISSION MEETING TUESDAY, JULY 20, 2021 
Chairman Clemons announced the next Commission M eeting wou ld be Tuesday, July 20, 2021, 
at 6:00 p.m. in the Commission Meeting Room. 

ADJOURN THE MEETING 
Commissioner Marchman made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Commissioner Watson 

seconded, and the meeting was adjourned at 9:07 a.m. 

<r::.., .~u}~ 
Kerry Wa son, ~ 
Associate Commissioner 



CULLMAN COUNTY SPECIAL CALLED COMMISSION AGENDA 
July 15, 2021 

1. Call to order and welcome guests 

2. Call of Roll to Establish Quorum 

3. NEW BUSINESS 

A. Consider Termination of Local Emergency due to the COVID-19 Coronavirus Pandemic 

B. Consider part icipation in the Investing in Alabama Counties Program wit h t he ACCA and authorize 

Cha irman to sign agreement 

C. Award Bid #1356: Corrugated Metal Pipe to Twin Oaks Environmental and ADCO Pipe & Supply 

LlC 

D. Award Bid #1357: lawn Care and Maintenance to Pro lawn 

4 . The next Commission Work Session will be Tuesday, July 20, 2021 at 4:00 p.m. in the Commission 

Meeting Room 

5. The next Commission Meeting w ill be Tuesday, July 20, 2021 at 6:00 p.m. in the Commission Meeting 

Room 

6. Adjourn 



PUBLIC NOTICE 

OFFICIAL NOTICE OF SPECIAL MEETING 
OF THE CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION 

The Cullman County Commission has called a Special Called Meeting for Thursday, July I 5, 
2021 at 9:00 a.m. to occur at the following location: 

Cullman County Courthouse 
Commission Conference Room 

500 Second Avenue SW, Room 105 
Cullman, Alabama 35055 

The sole purpose of this meeting is lo : 

A. Consider Termination of Local Emergency due to the COVID-19 Coronavirus Pandemic 

B. Consider participation in the Investing in Alabama Counties Program with the ACCA and authorize 

Chairman to sign agreement 

C. Bid #1356: Corrugated Metal Pipe 

D. Bid #1357: Lawn Care and Maintenance 

Dated this the 9nd day of July, 202 I. 

BY :/s/ Emilv Johnston 
Emily Johnston 
Attorney for Cullman County 
500 Second Avenue, S.W. 
Cullman, Alabama 35055 
Telephone: (256) 775-4893 



Association of County Commissions of Alabama 
Investing in Alabama Counties Program 

Maintenance and Support Membership Agreement 

The American Rescue Plan Act of 2021 

Pursuant to the Amelican Rescue Plan Act of 2021, federal funds will be allocated directly to Alabama 
counties based on the county share of the U.S. population based on the most recent data available from the 
U.S. Census Bureau. The first half of these funds will be distlibuted in May 2021 and the second half will be 
distributed not sooner than 12 months later. These funds are designed to aid in response to the COVID-19 
public health emergency and its negative impacts. The funds are to be used by December 31, 2024. 

Pursuant to the Amelican Rescue Plan Act of 2021, allowable uses of these funds are: 

• to respond to the public health emergency with respect toCOVID-19; 
• to provide assistance to households, small businesses and nonprofits related to the 

negative economic impacts ofCOVID-19; 
• to aid impacted Industries such as tourism, travel and hospitality; 
• to provide for government services to the extent of the reduction in revenue (i.e., online, 

properly or income tax) due to the public health emergency; 
• lo make necessary investments in water, sewer or broadband infrastructure; or 
• to include premium pay for eligible workers performing essential work (as determined 

by each state) during the pandemic. 

The United States Treasury is expected to issue more detailed guidelines for the expenditure of these funds 
in the near future. Alabama law will govern ways counties can offer services. Local governments are 
ultimately responsible for the appropriate use of the funds and should ensure that the proper internal controls 
are in place. 

Purpose of the ACCA Investing in Alabama Counties Program 
The Association of County Commissions of Alabama (The Association) is organized for the purpose of 
promoting betl!)r county government, economy, efficiency in office, and representing the interests of the 
several counties of the $late. The Association acts as an agency of cooperation among A[abj!ma's counties 
and other governmental bodies for the advancement of the joint and s.everal Interests and general welfare of 
its members. The Association wishes to partner with counties in developing programs that best meet the 
needs of the participating counties and have the greatest lasting impacf for each county. The Investing in 
Nabama Counties Program will serve as an educational, lnlergovemmenlal, compliance and technical 
resource lo participating counties for the admihistration, planning, management and completion of projects 
authorized by the Amelican Rescue Plan Act. 
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Based upon the foregoing, the Association of County Commissions of Alabama (hereinafter "The 
Association") and C cJIJ(tl<trt County Commission (hereinafter "The County") do 
hereby enter into this Maintenance and Support Membership Agreement (hereinafter "Agreement"). 

1. Pursuant to authority granted in Ala. Code § 11-1-15, Code of Alabama (1975), The County hereby 
agrees to participate in The Association's Investing in Alabama Counties Program wherein The Association 
will provide administrative, planning, management and completion support in the areas of educational, 
intergovernmental , compliance and technical assistance related to the use of funds received by The County 
from the American Rescue Plan Act of 2021. 

2. The County understands and agrees that ii will provide The Association with all information, 
cooperation and assistance that, in the opinion o!The Association, is necessary for the proper implementation 
of this Agreement. 

3. In maintenance and support of The Association's Investing in Alabama Counties Program, The 
County hereby agrees that ii will appropriate to The Association a flat fee of 6% on the first $7 million in funds 
to be received and 4% on any funds to be received in excess of S7 million. 

4. The County agrees that it will report to The Association the amount of the funds the County receives 
as the first tranche payment within 30 days of receipt of the funds or within 30 days of entering into this 
agreement whichever occurs later. The County agrees that it will report to The Association the amount of 
the funds the County receives as the second tranche payment and any subsequent payment within 30 days 
of receipt of the funds or within 30 days of entering into this agreement whichever occurs later. 

5. The Association will provide an invoice to the County based on the funds received by the County as 
the first tranche payment, with the fee to be paid in accordance with the terms of paragraph 3 to the Association 
no later than October 6, 2021. The Association will provide an invoice to the County based on the funds 
received by the County as the secood tranche payment and any subsequent payment with the fee lo be paid in 
full to the Association within 30 days of receipt of an invoice. 

6. The County agrees that it will comply with the requirements of The American Rescue Plan Act of 
2021, any written guidelines provided by the United States Department of Treasury or the Office of the 
Inspector General, and all applicable requirements under Alabama or federal law. The Association will not 
be financially and/or legally responsible for any misuse of the funds by the County. 

7. All parties understand and agree that all information exchanged with each other and/or any other 
entity pursuant to this Agreement and any procedures for the implementation, operation, or administration of 
the Investing in Alabama Counties Program, including but not limited to printed, written, oral, or computer­
formatted information, shall be held in the strictest confidence and shall be used solely for the purposes that 
are the subject of this Agreement, unless otherwise provided by law. Both parties shall fully maintain 
confidentiality of such information not only during the course of the performance of this Agreement but 
following its termination, unless otherwise provided bylaw. 

8. Both parties agree that this Agreement shall become effective upon execution by both parties and 
remain and continue in full force and effect until December 31, 2024, unless and until terminated in writing 
by either party upon 90 days written notice to the other party. Upon termination of the Agreement, a refund 
will be limited to unearned fees. 
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9. By signing this Agreement, both parties affirm, for the duration of the Agreement, that they will not 
violate federal immigration law or knowingly employ, hire for employment, or continue to employ an 
unauthorized alien within the Stale of Alabama. Furthermore, a party found to be in violation of this provision 
shall be deemed in breach of the Agreement and shall be responsible for all damages resulting therefrom. A 
party found to be in violation of this provision shall not be entiUed to a refund of any fees previously paid. 

10. This Agreement is not assignable or transferrable to any other party. 

11 . This Agreement shall be construed, and the provisions hereof interpreted under and in accordance 
with the laws of the State of Alabama. 

12. Should any provision of this Agreement be declared or determined by any court lo be illegal or invalid, 
the validity of the remaining parts, terms or provisions shall not be affected thereby and said illegal or invalid 
part, term, or provision shall be deemed not to be a part of lhisAgreement. 

13. The terms of this Agreement may be supplemented, amended or modified as necessary under the 
provisions of the American Rescue Plan Act of 2021 or federal or state guidance and to allow for the besl 
delivery of services to the County. No supplement, amendment or modification of this Agreement shall be 
binding unless it is in writing and signed by both parties. 

14. This Agreement represents the full and final understanding of the parties with respect to the subject 
matter described herein and supersedes any and all prior agreements or understandings, written or oral, 
express, or implied. 

Executed on this the / Ult day of Ju f V , 2021 . 

THE COUNTY 

Tille 

ASSOCIATION OF COUNTY COMMISSIONS OF 
ALABAMA 

By: ___________ _ 

Signature of Authorized Agent 

Tille 
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' Bid No. 1356 

INVITATION TO BIDDERS 

The Cullman County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, July 
13, 2021 in Room 105 of the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for corrugated 
metal pipe for the Cullman County Road Department and various municipalities in Cullman 
County. At this time sealed bids will be publicly opened and read aloud. 

This bid will be a cooperative bid between the Cullman County Commission and the 
following municipalities located within Cullman County. 

City of Good Hope, Town of Colony, Town of Garden City, Town of Dodge City, Town 
of Holly Pond, Town of Baileyton, Town of Fairview. Town of West Point, City of Hanceville, 
Cullman County Board of Education, City of Cullman, and the Town of Berlin. 

The award of this bid will be made by the Cullman County Commission on behalf of all 
indicated governmental entities. 

Each participating governmental entity will be responsible for issuing its own purchase 
orders, delivery instructions, invoicing, insurance requirements, and issue its own tax exemption 
certificates as required by vendors. 

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to 
waive any formalities in the bidding. 

This bid shall be for a period of three (3) months from dau of award. 

Bid price shall be indicated as a percentage off the retail prices shown on the attached list 
for each size and type pipe. 

BID TOTAL: NA %DISCOUNT 

ADCO Pipe & Supply, LLC 

Company 

4014 Florence Blvd. 

Address 

Florence. AL 35634 

256-757-7473 PHONE NO FAX 

Phone/Fax 

Tim Bergstresser 

Representative 



CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION 
ROAD DEPARTMENT 

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE - PRICE PER LINEAR FT 
BID NO.: _________ __ _ 

CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 9/30/2021 

2·2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION Plck-Ue 

-d Round High Flow 

DIAM GAGE Oalvlnlzed. Alurnind (na-0,12) 
Round 

Galvlnlud. 

12"x20',24" 16 (0.064) $21.55 

15"x20',24' 16 $25.85 

18"x20' 24' 16 $32.32 

21· 16 NOBID 

24"x20',24' 16 $40.94 

30" 16 NO BID $63.81 

36"x20',24' 16 $62.48 

42"x24' 16 $73.26 

48"x24',30' 16 $81.88 

12" 14 (0.079) 

16'' 14 

18" 14 

21· 14 

24" 14 

30" 14 

36" 14 

42" 14 

48" 14 

$32.01 

$39.88 
$47.87 
$55.83 
$63.81 
$79.75 

$95.71 

$111 .66 
$127.61 

21· 12 (0.109) NO BID NOBID 

24" 12 
30• 12 

36" 12 

NO BID 

$87.83 
ctrno no 
$130.27 

42" 12 

48" 12 

~.,, « 

$172.81 
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.. Dallvered 

Aluminized 
Round High Flow 

Alum- (naapprox0.12) 

$28.03 

<e'>? 77 

$41 .01 
NOBID 
$51.96 
$65.64 
$79.32 $94.97 
$92.99 $1 13.97 

$103.0 ? $126.62 

$32.82 
$41.03 

$49.23 
$57.42 
$65.64 

!1:82.05 --· .. $117.13 
$1 14 .87 $136.12 

$131.27 $155.1 1 

NOBID 

$90.25 
$112.13 

$134.01 
$155.90 Cl:186.77 

$177.77 $212.09 



CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 
BIDNO.: ___________ _ 

CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/2012021 TO 9/30/2021 

2-2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION Plck.Ue .. Delivered 

SPAN-BISE Round Round 
(DIAMETER} GAGE GaMnlzad. Alumlzad 

1r>C13" (15") 16 (0.064) 

21"X15" (18") 16 
24 "X 18" (21 ") 16 

28"X20" (24") 16 

35"X24" (30") 16 

42"X29' (36") 16 

$34.30 $32.29 
$42.87 $44.12 
$48.60 $49.99 

$54.31 $55.88 
$68.61 $70.60 
$82.90 $85.29 

49"X33" ( 42") 16 $97.20 $99.99 

srX38" t 48") 16 $108.62 $111.75 

1r>C13" (15") 14 (0.079) 

21-X15" (18" 14 

$42.88 ~4.12 
$51 .54 $52.94 

24-X18" (21" 14 
28"X20" (24") 14 
35"X24" (30") 14 
42"X29" (36") 14 

49"X33" (42") 14 

$60.02 $61.75 
$68.61 $70.58 

$85.75 $88.22 
$102.91 $105.87 

$120.06 $123.51 

5rX38" (48") 14 $137.21 $141 .16 

24"X18" (21"l 12 (0.109) NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

28"X20" (24") 12 
35"X24" (30") 12 

$94.34 $97.04 

$117.21 $120.57 

42"X29" (36") 12 <1:140.08 $144.10 

49"X33" ( 42") 12 $162.94 $167.62 

57"X38" (48") 12 $185.81 $191.16 

Page 2 of 4 



CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BIDNO.: ------------
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 9/30/2021 

5" X 1" .. Corrugations Pick-Up 

Round Round 

D~ER GAGE Gelvlnlzed. Alumlzed 

54• 12 

60" 12 

66" 12 

72" 12 

78" 12 

84" 12 

90" 12 

96" 12 

54• 10 

60" 10 

66" 10 

72• 10 

78" 10 

84" 10 

90' 10 

96" 10 

5" X 1" 
1'XX)(X Corrugations Pick.Up 

SPAN::Bl§E Round Round 

!DIAMETER} GAGE GalVlnlud. Alumlzed 

64"X43" (54") 12 

71"X4T' (60"\ 12 

77"X52" (66"} 12 

83"x57" (72") 12 

8T'X63" (78") 12 

95''X67" (84") 12 

103"x71" (90"\ 12 

112"x75" (96") 12 

64"X43" (54") 10 

71"X47" (60") 10 

77"X52" (66") 10 
83'x57" (72") 10 

87"x63" (78") 10 
95"x67" (84") 10 

103"x71 • (90"\ 10 
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•• Delivered 

Round 
Alumlud 

$217.62 
:)>L41.21 

$264.82 
$288.41 

$312.00 
$335.60 

$357.19 
$385.40 

$277.92 
$309.38 

$338.21 
$367.06 
$398.52 

$429.98 
$458.82 
:)14\IL.tll 

•• Delivered 

Round Round 
Galvlnlzed. Alumlzed 

$234.00 
$259.36 

$284.74 
$310.12 
$335.48 
$360.86 
$300.22 

$414.42 

$298.84 
$332.68 
$363.68 

$394.69 
$428.52 
$462.34 

$493.37 



• . . . 
CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE· PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BID NO.: -------------CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 9l30/2021 

112•x75" (96") 

BAND CHARGE 

10 

12 INCH-36 IDC DIA. PER FT. 
42 INCH-60 II X DIA. PER FT. 
66 INCH ANDC DIA. PER FT. 

LIFTING LUGS: $30.00 Each 

IMPORTANT NOTES TO THIS BID: 

1' Wide Bands = 2 x The foot price of Pipe 
1' Wide Bands = 2.5 x The foot price of Pipe 
2' Wide Bands = 6 x The foot Price of Pipe 

.. $5000 Minimum Order for all sizes of Delivered Pipe and Bands 60" and above . 

$530.02 

.. Delivery Charges will be Incurred if a minimum order is not met for all sizes of delivered pipe and bands 60" and above. 
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,. r BidNo. 1356 

INVITATION TO BIDDERS 

. The Culhnan County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.m., Tuesday, July 
13, 2021 in Room 105 of the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for corrugated 
metal pipe for the Cullman County Road Department and various municipalities in Cullman 
County. At this time sealed bids will be publicly opened and read aloud. 

This bid will be a cooperative bid between the Cullman County Commission and the 
following municipalities located within Cullman County. 

City of Good Hope, Town of Colony, Town of Garden City, Town of Dodge City, Town 
of Holly Pond, Town of Baileyton, Town of Fairview, Town of West Point, City of Hanceville, 
Cullman County Board of Education, City of Cullman, and the Town of Berlin. 

The award of this bid will be made by the Cullman County Commission on behalf of all 
indicated governmental entities. 

Each participating governmental entity will be responsible for issuing its own purchase 
orders, delivery instructions, invoicing, insurance requirements, and issue its own tax exemption 
certificates as required by vendors. 

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to 
waive any formalities in the bidding. 

This bid shall be for a period of three (3) months from date of award. 

Bid price shall be indicated as a percentage off the retail prices shown on the attached list 
for each size and type pipe. 

BID TOTAL: 0 % DISCOUNT Afm.t"'c.a -p<i<.;~ '11'1<.\..,c.\c.S d.i:!lcowd-

-:i;, .. Cb.1£S fr,v1f"a-i~\ 
Company 

'P. o. 'Bo)£. 103 
Address 

Opc,tikA AL 3t;.~o'3 

(33"!) 11./S- 74'14 
'r;hone/F ax 

:J:o),;e. W()\.,+,\Ov\....) 
Representative 



storm <Drainage 

rf win Oa~ <F,nvironmenta{ 
OPELIKA ALABAMA 
WWW. m y,V0,4.l{.S,EIN.COM 

'Erosion SuppfieS 

CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSIONS CORRUGATED METAL PIPE BID 
Bid No. 1356 CONTRACT PERIOD 7/20/2021 to 9/30/2021 

Minimum order of $4500 required for free freight. For orders less than this amount, there 
will be a $2.50 per loaded mile added FOB plant in Wmder Ga. 

Orders containing large diameter pipe of 102" or greater requires a wide load permit to 
transport. There will be an added $2.00 per loaded mile per truck added FOB plant in 
Winder Ga. 

RAW MATERIAL PRICE INCREASE EXCALATION CLAUSE; Upon advanced 
written notice to Cullinan County Commissions, Twin Oaks Environmental shall be 
entitled to an immediate adjustment of the price per foot of corrugated metal culvert pipe 
by the amount of the increase in Raw Materials costs where any increase in Raw Material 

· costs increase the total price per foot of said pipe by 5% or more. Twin Oaks 
Environmental shall provide sufficient documentation to support any unit price 
adjustment. 

County Representative _ _____ _______ _ _ 



CULLMAN COUNTY COMMISSION 
ROAD DEPA~TMENT 

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BID NO.: I 3SE, 
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 9/30/2021 

2-2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION Pick-UI! 

Round Round High Flow Round 

DIAM GAGE G•lvlnlnd. Alumlzed (n "approx 0,12) Galvlnlzed. 

12" 16 (0.064) 14. 'L I ,~.oi. 
16" 16 ,., ib 18,, I 
18" 16 ? T • ., f. ZZ ,l'i 
21· 16 ,s.q1 ?.7. '2.~ . 
24" 16 28.oq 2'1,5--cf 

lb.2.'-
10,'2.0 
Z'i,l'f 
24 qs-
31. 'f'b 

30" 16 1.q_q ?> '1.£.,30 

36" 16 -Ql . ,-» iil.J,6 I 
"J' .,'I 
LI" ,f:!I 

42" 16 LIQ, '2.C> SI. 3Z. 
48" 16 s,. ,~ S'f, 1q 

ss.'i, 
~3.'1Z. 

12• 14 (0.079) ,J 0. No. 
15" 14 2 .. g3 2.l 

Na. 
2'i, ?'f 

18" 14 . , .oE> ?7 U4.f 
21· 14 . ,.- 3J,:s I 

-z.q_,s 
"3,:2g, 

24" 14 Li,f>O 1.c;..;l..u 
30" 14 1 1. cu~ qs. -i.3 

,. "· is 
,l8.9S 

36" 14 Sl.38 .S'I. 1-Z. 
42" 14 SCJ.8:Z. &3.C1.. 58. """ ~.OS 
48" 14 -1!.8, 1. i ,,. er I 77,,7 

21· 12 (0.109) 111.11 44.01 
24" 12'(7,l,C ..,,. .... , ... 1.17, S2. 

""·'s 
30• 12 sq. 1.'i ,2..1~ I :.7;6'1 

36" 12 70.t, I -?LI, f,1 0.'=-5 
42" 12 81..53 At.. q I.I 
48" 12 q4_\7 ({Cl. i.1 

:o, ~'1 
/07./) 

Delivered 

Round High Flow 
Alumlzed (••-o• 0.12) 

17, II ,. 
'2.1,2 'I 
2s.1.1, 
JO.<f8' 
3'.~. ~b 
41.8'7 
So,Oi 
s~.qs 
E, 7, ') 'I 

Al. 

i,.n 
31. i.t.. 
'3~-\ 2,.. 
41.3'1 
SJ. I.I'-

~I. c; 7 

71.10 
g ), ~, 
t::.r..C'? 
'57 ou -'I .. (') l!> 
:u.-
'iS-. 'ti 
11i .~1 

Ifie" -4lloc., i~ ti..._ so.1111c.. pric.e,. ~ e,_;41..v 3c-li1c.t';~,d o.r o..lC,\Mini~c: d depcndi0 or, #t.. 

Ceo-~-
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I . 

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BID NO. : 135C.. 
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO · 9/30/2021 

2-2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION Pick-lie Delivered 

SPAN-RISI; Round Round 

{DIAM§!l;Bl GAGE Gelvf nlzed, Alumlzed 
I Round I Round 

G1Mnlnd. Alumlzed 

1rx13• (15" 16 (0.064) \<too 20.oz. 
21"X15" (18" 16 2,?..71.j 'Z. '}. 'I(. 

24"X18" 21· 16 ?7 7'1.. 1tl '"' 
26"X20" 24") 16 ,i,o .oc:. • .,_,_G,(:, 

35"X24" (30" 16 -Z."7 '}'3' YI .?.>'6 
42''X29" 36" 16 /.{" "10 '17.~ 
49"X33" ( 42'1 16 52..,"f SS,li5 
5rx38" 48") 16 GO .IZ. ~:;-~} 

-z., .~ l. . :a: Zt.,T 
2s.t1 '2.'7, '1.6 

31. S'I 3,3.IS 
3(4, I 'I J4,01. 

u,::>3 uii, B'O 
<:o,ts 5::,.:, ·1 

S'f. 'if<t ~= 
bB'-t.lD 72-,0S 

1rx13• (15") 14 (0.079) z.~.¼ 
2.~ ·"' 

21·x1s· c1a· 14 1-:1.<n 2-'i . ~1 
24"X18" (21" 14 '"-" J 1.. "\~.1b 
28"X20" (24j 14 ;¼,qi_ 39.8'l 
35"X24" (30j 14 4S.'lj II~ ,LIO 

42"X29" 136i 14 S'l ,<i7 S7,'II 

49"X33' (42") 14 G'f ,01 ~ /. "43 
57"X38" 148'') 14 73,05 7o."f'f 

,Z6. Tl, "N 
1 .7'2. 33.41 
~ . 32. '4() .~D 
LIZ,oo LJ1,/ 261 
"-2..'?.l>' --ss. 06 
c:;2.SLf f.S.n 
71.. f/'Z. -,,-:-,i 
st?,, I I 81,S-• 

24"X18" (21") 12 (0.109) uu,c, 47.0'-f 
28"X20" (24") 12 SC q1 s.;. 65 
35"X24" (30") 12 C.3.3~ "'·',g 
42"X29" (36") 12 75.%5 -,~ llr 

49"X33" ( 42"1 12 8B'.'31 q3,ci 
57"X38" (48') 12 1()().71 IOb, 15 

5 6 .~S <'3,'-7 
$7, qi, ,,.o, 
7t. I 1. "7-S,q ' 
Rf, :z.q QO.~O 
100"47 I I><., 't(1,{ 

llli,G'f l '2.0, 7L. 
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CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BID NO. : I ~5 b 
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 9/30/2021 

~ I" X 1" Corru9atlons Pick-Up Delivered 

Round Round Round Round 

DIAMETER GAGE Galvlnlzed. AlumJzed Galvini:red. Alumized 

54" 12 I I ··"2. Hi.t'I 
60" 12 11.' ,.LI'- ,~.110 

12.'. q'f ~1)3,fi4. 
lr.tl,,-:!1 . ,. IO. 'fCI 

66" 12 1~7.'ln 11.l"i, 37 15'>,'3 I '"'l. ?..' 
7211 12 l'ICI E.i lS7. 2., 170,1.7 . l"R" 
78" 12 IL1,q·.'.> 170.14 I ~.i.z. 1q2 S, 
84" 12 17l/, l'I 111?, .ot. 3 .I 7 'Zo'll',Z.. 
90" 12 115'-.~~ l'IS,'U 21'2. I'~ 2.z-i.,., 
96" 12 ~70 2-61J.7'j 1.U.OS 2'17.53 
54" 10 . 142.2-C \4U ,'ii lbl, 17 l~'l.'i8' 
60" 10 151,,a~ IL.S.~·• n'i.5b 1~8' .E,6 
66" 10 l,lf,1.S I tJ.O' lq8, ·u I . '2..08-2 '1 
72" 10 1qo., 'l 2Cb 3'- ZH,,'f 'l ,Z.'l:1, q4 
78" 10 20&.. 'Z.(f 21{:,. "7E. 2341,,0 ~'1 b.S't 
84" 10 '21.l,'i2.. '2.33.11' 2.5~.'11 2 ,s.i.s 
90" 10 'Z.'37, s "} 2(fq,$!' ?..70,'l.?, 2.1:>~'f 
96" 10 2<:117 2,,.a1 ,z.93.e1. 3c;-2., 3 

51" X 1" Corrusations Pick-Ue Delivered 

SPAN-RISE Round Round Round Round 
(DIAMETER} GAGE Galvlnized. Alumized Galvlnlzed. Alumlzed 

64"X43" (54") 12 11q, l.f3 12.5.SO 135,i 7 JLfl, 1ll 
71"X47" (60") 12 I 'JS.ti'- l'i0.60 IS'l.11 I S'i, q5 
77"X52" (66") 12 . l I 17.02. 15' • 1.17 lt,7, 1...G 11),t-' 
83"x57" {72") 12 lf>C>.11.f ID • 2.b I fi'2. IS' 1 q 1. 'i2. 
87''x63" (78") 12 1,3.'2.7 li2.f6 l'f7. n. 'a>7. II 
95''x67'' (84") 12 I 8b.3.8 I 'IS.)'!> '2.f 'l.r/-, '2.2.l.7~ 
103"x71 • (90") 12 l'ili.S/ -Z.0"1. G 1.. z,?.,R- · 23~.'4, 
112"x75" {96") 12 ZIZ.,6J Z..Z."!>./../b 21,f I • 'l'f Z.S'i,IS 

64"X43" (54") 10 1-52,lb IS'l.'i'l 173. II 1~1.n 
71"X47" (60") 10 1or.r, 177, 41./ 112.. ll- 201.t, 
77"X52" {66") 10 l8'b.4S l'fS.qn 2-12.. l'Z. ,Z.2:Z.'l 7 
83"x57" (72") 10 2.0'f ,C,3 z1u.,z 'l~l.17 '2. '1 3 . 'a-'I 
87"x63" (78") 10 ~'fj Z.$1,'13 
95''x67" (84") 10 2.:J . '4S . 2't'l. K> 

., S'Z. I.It 2~3.t6 
210 .1"1 u;.~ 

103"x71" (90") 10 z::;'1, I b 2f>7,C6 29'1, IS ic,3 -~' 
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CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE- PRICE PER LINEAR FT 

BID NO.: \ 3$f. 
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/20/2021 TO 

112"x75" (96") 

BAND CHARGE 12 INCH-36 IIX DIA. PER FT. I 1. 
42INCH-60 11 X DIA. PER FT. l,S)I. 
66 INCH ANCX DIA. PER FT. \, 5)1. 

LIFTING LUGS: 1t \ $ C:C\ 

; 

9/30/2021 

Page 4 of 4 



Bid No.1357 

INVITATION TO BIDDERS 

The Cullman County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.ro., Wednesday, July 14, 2021, in 
Room 105 of the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for lawn care and maintenance at 
various county locations. At this time sealed bids will be publicly opened and read aloud. 

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to waive any 
fonnalities in the bidding. 

All bids must comply with State of Alabama bid requirements. 

Any questions regarding this bid shoulcfbe directed to John Bullard, County Administrator, at (256) 
775-4925. 

If mutually agreeable between both parties, Cullman County may extend the period in one-year 
increments up to 3 years. 

TOTAL LAWN CARE & MAINTENANCE FOR ONE YEAR: $_,,_<?,..._<+fi>D~,,___ 
~s <oe.p. ot=.t'.G, 11-l,, 2cot 4!'11 
:r..,,;, 5-An\t. -Pd o~ f', le, AL~A 

SUBMITTED BY: 

p,tO~ 
Name of Bidding Company 

~(Q'2c~ LJ, 17.. ,q 
Business Address 

ili \\~ ~~ AL 36ol} 
City, Stat'e, \zip 

Telephone, Area Code & Number 
,,,--

Fax Number 



-- Bid No.1357 

INVITATION TO BIDDERS 

The Cullman County Commission will be receiving bids until 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, July 14, 2021, i 
Room I 05 of the Cullman County Courthouse, Cullman, Alabama, for lawn care and maintenance at 
various county locations. At this time sealed bids will be publicly opened and read aloud. 

The Cullman County Commission reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to waive any 
formalities in the bidding. 

All bids must comply with State of Alabama bid requirements. 

Any questions regarding this bid should be directed to John Bullw-d, County Administrator, at (256) 
775-4925. 

If mutually agreeable between both parties, Cullman County may extend the period in one-year 
increments up to 3 years. 

I ,t< 1100 I ()O TOTAL LAWN CARE & MAINTENANCE FOR ONE YEAR: s_o_~_ . _<:T~~--
1 

SUDMJTTED BY: 

Cl ~cuds Luiols Ca12 (oa 
Name ;fBidding Company ' -;.:; 

J/?O lo fl.d Ir/ q 
Business Address 

Culltnao )!, 3 s::o,rs> 
City, State, Zip 

Telephone, Area Code & Number 

Fax Number 


